
 

 

 

 

Privacy and Information Policy 

 

I, the Applicant, give my consent to the processing to the Institute of Innovative 
Technologies in Business LLC (location: St. Petersburg, Petrogradskaya emb., 22), 
including its structural divisions, of the categories of personal data specified in this 
application (including cookies, my ip address, geographic location, request initiation 
time, address of the visited web page, full name, phone number, e-mail), including 
collection, recording, systematization, accumulation, use, storage, clarification 
(updating, changing) , extraction, transfer (distribution, provision, access), including 
among third parties, depersonalization, blocking, deletion and destruction, both by 
the Institute independently and with the involvement of third parties as performers. 

The processing of my personal data is carried out for the purpose of fulfilling 
obligations, concluding and executing contracts between me and the Institute, 
instructing the Institute to process my personal data to other persons, obtaining any 
information using any means of communication, including telecommunications and 
mail, including about the services of the Institute, advertising, termination of my 
obligations to the Institute or the Institute to me, as well as interaction with the 
Institute on other issues. The processing of my personal data can be carried out by 
using automation tools and without using such tools, as well as in other ways, taking 
into account the technologies available at the Institute. This consent is valid for the 
period that is necessary to achieve the above purposes of processing personal data. 
If the federal law establishes a different period for the storage of personal data, this 
application is subject to storage in the manner established by the legislation on 
archiving in the Russian Federation, within the period established by law. This 
consent may be withdrawn by me at any time by submitting a written application to 
the Institute. 


